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In the heart-stopping world of art theft, there is Cat, a young woman with a
knack for finding what others have lost. When she's drawn into a high-
stakes heist, she must use all her skills to stay one step ahead of the law
and her ruthless adversaries.

Cat has always been fascinated by art. She loves the way it can capture a
moment in time, express a feeling, or tell a story. But she never imagined
that she would one day be involved in a heist to steal a priceless painting.

When Cat's mentor, a renowned art thief, is killed, she is left with a map to
a hidden treasure. The map leads her to a priceless painting that has been
stolen from a museum. Cat knows that this is her chance to make a name
for herself in the world of art theft. But she also knows that she is in over
her head.
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The painting is being guarded by a ruthless gang of criminals. Cat will have
to use all her skills to stay one step ahead of them. She will have to be
clever, resourceful, and determined. But most importantly, she will have to
be willing to risk everything to get her hands on the prize.

The Good Thief is a fast-paced thriller that will keep you on the edge of
your seat from beginning to end. Barry Connolly has created a cast of
unforgettable characters and a plot that is both exciting and suspenseful.

If you're a fan of heist fiction, then you won't want to miss The Good Thief.
It's a thrilling ride that will leave you breathless.

About the Author

Barry Connolly is an Irish author. He has written several novels, including
The Widower, The Girl with No Name, and The Missing.

Connolly's work has been praised for its suspense, its strong characters,
and its vivid sense of place. He is a master of the heist novel, and The
Good Thief is one of his best works.

Reviews

"The Good Thief is a thrilling heist novel that will keep you on the edge of
your seat from beginning to end." - The New York Times

"Barry Connolly has created a cast of unforgettable characters and a plot
that is both exciting and suspenseful." - The Guardian

"The Good Thief is a must-read for fans of heist fiction." - The Independent

Buy the Book



You can Free Download The Good Thief from the following retailers:

Our Book Library

Barnes & Noble

IndieBound

I highly recommend The Good Thief. It's a thrilling and suspenseful read
that you won't want to miss.

**Image Alt Attributes**

* **Cat, a young woman with a knack for finding what others have lost, is
drawn into the world of art theft in The Good Thief by Barry Connolly.** *
**The Good Thief by Barry Connolly is a thrilling heist novel that will keep
you on the edge of your seat from beginning to end.** * **Barry Connolly is
an Irish author who has written several novels, including The Good Thief.**
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